
 
 
 

 
TRAFFIC SIGNAL SEQUENCE REPORT 

 
Introduction 

 
This Traffic Sequence Report has been prepared for the intersection of Lower King Street and 
Bruce Highway, Caboolture on the 24th November 2013. 
 
The purpose of this report is to explain the operation of the traffic signals, provide the critical signal 
timing data and identify any faults that may have occurred with the signal operation for the time 
requested. 
 
TMR Intersection Identification Number 
 
M7048 
 
Traffic Signal Location 
 
Intersection of Lower King Street and Bruce Highway, Caboolture. 
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Aerial Photography Image 
 
No image has been provided as the intersection configuration has changed since the 24th 
November 2013. 
 
Traffic Signal Operation 
 
The basic objective of the use of signal control is the time separation of conflicting traffic 
movements to ensure safe operation of the intersection. 
 
Within the traffic signal controller, traffic movements are associated with ‘signal groups’ (groups of 
signals that are connected on the same electrical circuit so that they always show the same 
display). These signal groups are allocated to phases (unique groups of traffic movements; see 
definition below). This grouping of movements and allocation to phases, or design of the signal 
phasing, should result in safe and efficient control of the specific intersection layout with the traffic 
volumes being considered.  
 
The signal phasing, together with other data defining the operation of an intersection, is called the 
‘controller personality’. This data is ‘burnt’ onto an erasable reprogrammable read only memory 
module (EPROM) which must be plugged into a ‘slot’ in the controller central processor unit for the 
controller to operate. 
 
Traffic signals can operate independently (isolated mode) or coordinated with adjacent signalised 
intersections operating on a common cycle time. 
 
Isolated Mode 
 
When operating in the isolated mode, the signals are operating in isolation from any other adjacent 
traffic signals and do not operate on set phase times. The phases operate in vehicle actuation 
mode whereby they are called when the vehicle detectors register occupancy.  
 
Vehicle detectors are loops of wire buried in the pavement connected to a sensor unit housed in a 
roadside cabinet. The inductance of the loop changes when metal is present above the loop and 
this change is used to detect the vehicles. If a vehicle is sitting on the detector for 2 seconds, it 
then registers that there is a demand for the appropriate phase. 
 
The intersection will remain in Phase A until a demand is registered on the loop detectors for any 
other phase. If a demand for another phase occurs, the signals will change through the phase 
sequence to the demanded phase/s either after a three second gap is registered in the demand for 
A Phase or when A Phase reaches its maximum green time, whichever comes first. 
 
Coordinated Mode 
 
In order to coordinate a route of signalised intersections, all the intersections within the route will 
operate on a common cycle time. The timing of the signals is controlled by various ‘time of day’ 
plans according to the expected traffic conditions throughout the day. Each phase in the cycle 
within each plan is allocated set duration times. These phase duration times vary dependant on 
pre-set criteria such as phase release settings and pedestrian frequency.  
 
The amber, red and minimum green time settings “Critical Phase Time Settings” (Table 3) will 
always apply to any phase when called in the coordinated mode.  
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Intersection Operation at Time of the Incident 
 
Due to the intersection has been modified, operational system records no longer exist for the 24th 
November 2013. 
 
There were no faults recorded on the 24th November 2013.  
 
Note: The intersection traffic signal controller incorporates protection that will not allow green 
lanterns to be displayed to conflicting traffic movements at any time. The traffic lights are designed 
to automatically switch off within 100 milliseconds if this occurs. 
 
Intersection Signal Phasing 
 
On the 24th November 2013 traffic movements at this intersection were controlled by 3 traffic 
phases as shown below, see attached M7048_BruceHwyNBRamps&Cab-BribieIsland 
406726F.pdf for more detail. 
 
Phases are broken into Signal Groups (SG) or aspects as shown by the numbered arrows in phase 
diagram below. 
 

 
 
Diagram 1 – Traffic Signal Plan for M7048 Lower King Street and Bruce Highway  
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Intersection Signal Phasing 
 
On the 24th November 2013 traffic movements at intersection M7048 were controlled by 3 traffic 
phases. 
 
Table 1 sets out the traffic lights or aspects displayed to traffic on each approach. For this report; 
Lower King Street is identified as the east / west approach and Bruce Highway is referred to as the 
south / north approach. 
 
Aspects have been labelled below with the Signal Group (SG) to correspond with the Intersection 
Phasing Diagram in Diagram 1 
 
Note: This report cannot specifically identify which traffic lights or aspects were being displayed at 
the exact time of the incident as the precise time cannot be identified. 
 
Table 1 – Aspect Display for M7048 

Phase Traffic Light / Aspect Displayed to Traffic 

 West Approach 
Lower King Street 

East Approach 
Lower King Street 

South Approach 
Bruce Highway 

North Approach 
Bruce Highway 

A 

SG6  SG1 SG2  SG5 SG3  SG4   

B 

SG6   SG1 SG2  SG5 SG3  SG4  

C 

SG6   SG1 SG2  SG5 SG3  SG4  
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Table 2 sets out the traffic lights or aspects displayed to pedestrians on each approach for each 
phase. Note: Pedestrian lanterns (aspects) only illuminate during the phase if demanded via push 
button. 
 
Table 2 – Pedestrian Display for M7048 

Phase Traffic Light / Aspect displayed to Pedestrians crossing 

 West Approach 
Lower King Street 

North Approach 
Bruce Highway 

A 

SG7 (PED1)   SG8 (PED2)  

B 

SG7 (PED1)  SG8 (PED2)  

C 

SG7 (PED1)  SG8 (PED2)  

 
Table 2 – Pedestrian Display for M7048 
 
 
Critical Phase Time Settings 
 
Due to the intersection has been modified critical phase time settings no longer exist for the 24th 
November 2013. 
 
 
Prepared by: 
 
 

Document Prepared: 6th November 2017 
 
Bryce Llewellyn – A Principal Engineer (Traffic) 
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